
 

Johnny  
SS 555 

Johnny 
In the highest reading 
group. 

Johnny 
Librarian reports that 
Johnny enjoys 
reading about 
science. 

Johnny 
Favorite food is 
macaroni and 
cheese. 

Johnny 
SGP 50 

Johnny 
High performing in 
Math, but struggles to 
explain his answers. 

Johnny  
The art teacher 
reports he has a hard 
time in art class. 

Johnny  
The Bus driver 
reports that Johnny 
reads to his little 
brother on the bus 
every morning. 

Johnny 
GE 4.9 

Johnny 
Mom wants him to 
skip a grade. 

Johnny  
Cafeteria monitor 
reports that he takes 
a book with him to 
lunch every day and 
does not talk to 
anyone. 

Johnny  
Dad says that Johnny 
listens to country 
music at home and 
wants to play the 
guitar. 

Johnny 
PR 85 

Johnny 
Teachers want him to 
get RTI support for 
his writing and fine 
motor skills. 

Johnny 
Lexile 790 

Johnny 
NYSTP Level 3 

Johnny 
Struggles with writing 
and fine motor tasks. 

Johnny 
He is the youngest in 
his grade. 

Johnny 
The nurse reports 
that Johnny has 
some anxiety.  

Johnny 
At or above 
Benchmark 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Krista 
SS 555 

Krista 
NYSTP Level 1 

Krista 
Krista’s teacher 
reports that she uses 
her close reading 
strategies. 

Krista 
Krista complained to 
the teacher that many 
of the STAR 
questions timed out 
before she could 
answer. 

Krista 
GE 4.9 

Krista 
Benchmark Urgent 
Intervention 

Krista 
Mom reports that 
Krista is a 
perfectionist. 

Krista 
The Spanish teacher 
reports that Krista 
tutors other students 
after school who 
need help with 
Spanish. 

Krista 
SGP 10 

Krista 
Guidance says that 
Krista’s grades are all 
90% or above. 

Krista 
The social studies 
teacher says that in 
class Krista is 
reading a 1000 Lexile 
without a problem. 

Krista 
The district has a 
policy that any 
students that score 
below the 40th PR 
need to go to RTI. 

Krista 
PR 19 

Krista 
The PE teacher 
reports that Krista is 
captain of her soccer 
team.  

Krista 
Nurse reports that 
Krista’s hearing and 
vision tests were 
normal. 

Krista 
The RTI teacher 
wants to know what 
to do with Krista 
because she is does 
not belong in RTI. 

Krista 
Lexile 750 

Krista 
She enjoys working 
with kids and wants 
to be a teacher. 

Krista 
Dad reports that 
Krista likes to take 
her time with her 
work.  
 

Krista 
The principal wants 
Krista to take the test 
again, but Krista says 
it will just time out on 
her again. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Dominick 
SS 555 

Dominick 
NYSTP Level  2 

Dominick 
Enjoys surfing and 
skateboarding. 

Dominick 
The ELA teacher 
recommended RTI 
support after 
Dominick’s first 
quarter. 

Dominick 
PR 40 

Dominick 
Benchmark 
Intervention 

Dominick 
His records from 
Florida say that 
Dominick was 
performing on grade 
level. 

Dominick 
The RTI teacher is 
seeing some growth, 
but says that 
Dominick mentions 
that he is bored and 
says there is nothing 
for him to do here. 

Dominick 
SGP 60 

Dominick 
PE teacher suggests 
that Dominick might 
like snowboarding. 

Dominick 
His math teacher 
says Dominick does 
really well with the 
math concepts but 
struggles a bit with 
reading the word 
problems. 

Dominick 
The librarian saw 
Dominick reading a 
magazine about 
surfing. 

Dominick 
GE 4.9 

Dominick 
Just moved to NY 
from Florida. 

Dominick 
His records from 
Florida indicate that 
he was in the 
skateboarding 
enrichment club. 

Dominick 
He has gotten in 
trouble a couple 
times in lunch for 
using his phone to 
text his friends. 

Dominick 
Lexile 950 

Dominick 
Homeroom teacher 
reports that Dominick 
says he misses his 
friends. 

Dominick 
The science teacher 
said that Dominick 
seemed excited 
about seeing snow 
for the first time. 

Dominick 
Dad is concerned 
that Dominick is 
spending so much 
time on his phone 
and in his room.  

 


